
Fun Ideas for 
Learning About 

Botany

Hands-On Botany



Leaf Pressing and Plant 
Identification Journal

Have kids collect leaves, 
flowers, and small plants, 
press them in a book, and 
then label each plant type. 
They can make their own 
botanical journal where 
they draw, write 
descriptions, and note each 
plant's unique traits, like 
leaf shape and flower 
color.

Create a DIY Indoor 
Garden

Set up a small indoor 
garden with easy-to-grow 
plants, like herbs or 
microgreens. Kids can 
monitor growth, measure 
changes, and learn about 
plant needs like sunlight, 
water, and soil.

Seed Starting
Experiment

Use clear cups or jars to 
grow seeds (beans work 
great) and observe root 
growth. Kids can compare 
seeds grown in different 
conditions (sun vs. shade, 
lots of water vs. little 
water) and see how each 
variable affects plant 
development.

Design a Plant
Part Salad

Help them create a salad 
where each ingredient 
represents a different 
plant part: carrots for 
roots, celery for stems, 
spinach for leaves, broccoli 
for flowers, and tomatoes 
for fruits. This delicious 
activity reinforces how 
each part contributes to 
the plant’s life cycle.

Nature Scavenger
Hunt

Plan a scavenger hunt 
where kids find different 
plant parts, types of 
leaves, flowers, and seeds. 
Make it extra engaging by 
giving clues related to the 
plant types or unique 
traits they should look for, 
like “a leaf with jagged 
edges” or “a yellow 
flower.”

Planting a Butterfly
Garden

Teaching the role of plants 
in ecosystems can be fun 
by creating a small 
butterfly or pollinator 
garden. Kids can learn 
which plants attract 
butterflies, bees, and birds 
and see firsthand how 
plants support other life 
forms.

Leaf Chromatography

Use simple chromatography 
(blotting the color from 
leaves onto paper with 
rubbing alcohol) to explore 
the pigments in green 
leaves. This activity helps 
kids see how leaves have 
hidden colors and 
understand how chlorophyll 
and other pigments work.

Time-Lapse
Plant Growth

Help them set up a 
time-lapse of plant growth 
by taking photos each day. 
Watching seeds grow into 
seedlings, then into mature 
plants, gives them a 
perspective on plant 
development and change 
over time.

Plant Parts Relay

Use clear cups or jars to 
grow seeds (beans work 
great) and observe root 
growth. Kids can compare 
seeds grown in different 
conditions (sun vs. shade, 
lots of water vs. little 
water) and see how each 
variable affects plant 
development.
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DIY Terrarium

Guide kids in creating a 
terrarium, a mini 
ecosystem in a jar. They’ll 
learn about the water 
cycle as condensation and 
evaporation happen within 
the jar, and they can 
observe how each plant 
grows over time.

Flower Dissection

Pick a few common 
flowers, like lilies or daisies, 
and help kids carefully 
dissect them to see the 
different parts (petals, 
pistils, stamens, etc.). They 
can label each part and 
learn about the plant's 
reproductive system and 
how pollination works.

Build a Plant
Cell Model

Create a 3D model of a 
plant cell using materials 
like clay, beads, and foam. 
Kids can paint and label 
each part (cell wall, 
chloroplasts, vacuole) and 
understand what makes 
plant cells unique.

Phototropism
Experiment

Place plants near a window 
and have kids rotate the 
pots regularly, tracking 
how the plant grows 
toward the light. This 
simple experiment 
demonstrates phototropism 
and teaches about plants’ 
responses to their 
environment.

Botany-Themed
Storytelling

Have kids create a story 
where they imagine life as 
a plant. They could 
describe a day in the life 
of a sunflower, or make up 
an adventure for a seed 
trying to find the best 
place to grow.

DIY Chlorophyll
Painting

Gather green leaves, smash 
them on watercolor paper 
with rocks or a hammer, 
and see the pigments 
transfer to create art. It’s 
a fun way to introduce 
chlorophyll and 
photosynthesis!

Plant Scavenger
Hunt Bingo

Make a bingo card with 
different types of plants 
or plant characteristics 
(like “evergreen,” 
“flowering,” “deciduous,” 
etc.), and have kids go 
outside to find as many as 
they can. It’s an interactive 
way to learn plant 
diversity.

Soil Testing Kit

Use a soil testing kit to 
investigate pH, nutrients, 
and other soil properties. 
Kids can test samples from 
different locations and 
discover what types of soil 
are best for different 
plants.

Tree Ring Investigation

Find a tree stump or a 
tree cross-section and look 
at its rings. Kids can count 
the rings to learn the 
tree’s age and look for 
clues about past weather 
conditions (wider rings in 
wet years, narrower in dry 
years).
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